

Hodges Loizzi
Eisenhammer Rodick & Kohn LLP

3030 SALT CREEK LANE
SUITE 202
ARLINGTON HEIGHTS, ILLINOIS 60005

TELEPHONE: (847) 670-9000
FACSIMILE: (847) 670-7334
FEIN: 36-3698066
www.hlerk.com

Stephanie Christensen
Post Office Box 71110
Oak Brook Terrace, IL 60181

May 31, 2020
Invoice #: 49028

REMITTANCE COPY

RE: PATEL v. HINSDALE 86
for [REDACTED]
CLAIM NO.: [REDACTED]
ADJUSTER: Stephanie Christensen
Date of Coverage: February 7, 2020
Initial Budget: \$ [REDACTED]
Previous Amount Billed: \$21,759.00 through 4/30/20

TOTAL SERVICES FOR THIS MATTER \$3,762.00

BILLING SUMMARY

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED	22.70 hrs	\$3,762.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF THIS BILL		\$3,762.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE		\$5,968.00
BALANCE DUE		<u>\$9,730.00</u>

Hodges Loizzi Eisenhammer Rodick & Kohn LLP

3030 SALT CREEK LANE
SUITE 202
ARLINGTON HEIGHTS, ILLINOIS 60005

TELEPHONE: (847) 670-9000
FACSIMILE: (847) 670-7334
FEIN: 36-3698066
www.hlerk.com

Stephanie Christensen
Post Office Box 71110
Oak Brook Terrace, IL 60181

May 31, 2020
Invoice # 49028

PATEL v. HINSDALE 86
for [REDACTED]
CLAIM NO.: [REDACTED]
ADJUSTER: Stephanie Christensen
Date of Coverage: February 7, 2020
Initial Budget: \$ [REDACTED]
Previous Amount Billed: \$21,759.00 through 4/30/20

05/04/2020	BB	L160 A106 Detailed correspondence to [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.50 hrs	210 /hr	\$105.00
05/05/2020	BB	L160 A106 Phone conference with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.40 hrs	210 /hr	\$84.00
05/05/2020	BB	L160 A106 Detailed email to [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.50 hrs	210 /hr	\$105.00
05/05/2020	DMS	L120 A103 Draft [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	3.00 hrs	190 /hr	\$570.00
05/06/2020	BB	L160 A106 Correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.80 hrs	210 /hr	\$168.00
05/06/2020	BB	L230 A104 Review [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.20 hrs	210 /hr	\$42.00
05/07/2020	BB	L160 A106 Correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.40 hrs	210 /hr	\$84.00
05/08/2020	BB	L160 A103 Continue preparing [REDACTED]	1.50 hrs	210 /hr	\$315.00
05/12/2020	BB	L160 A104 Review [REDACTED]	0.40 hrs	210 /hr	\$84.00
05/13/2020	BB	L160 A106 Conference call with [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.50 hrs	210 /hr	\$105.00

05/13/2020	BB	L160 A106 Correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20 hrs	210 /hr	\$42.00
05/13/2020	BB	L160 A104 Continue [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50 hrs	210 /hr	\$105.00
05/13/2020	BB	L160 A106 Correspond with [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.60 hrs	210 /hr	\$126.00
05/14/2020	BB	L160 A104 Prepare for [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50 hrs	210 /hr	\$105.00
05/14/2020	BB	L160 A109 Attend [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	2.40 hrs	210 /hr	\$504.00
05/14/2020	BB	L160 A106 Review [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.10 hrs	210 /hr	\$21.00
05/15/2020	BB	L160 A103 Prepare [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50 hrs	210 /hr	\$105.00
05/15/2020	BB	L160 A108 Correspond with opposing counsel re: [REDACTED]	0.40 hrs	210 /hr	\$84.00
05/18/2020	BB	L160 A108 Correspond with [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.20 hrs	210 /hr	\$42.00
05/18/2020	BB	L160 A108 Correspond with opposing counsel re: [REDACTED]	0.20 hrs	210 /hr	\$42.00
05/18/2020	BB	L230 A104 Review and approve [REDACTED]	0.20 hrs	210 /hr	\$42.00
05/18/2020	DMS	L160 A102 Research [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [NO CHARGE]	3.00 hrs	190 /hr	\$0.00
05/19/2020	BB	L230 A104 Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10 hrs	210 /hr	\$21.00
05/19/2020	DMS	L160 A102 Research [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [NO CHARGE]	1.50 hrs	190 /hr	\$0.00
05/22/2020	BB	L160 A108 Correspond with opposing counsel re: [REDACTED]	0.20 hrs	210 /hr	\$42.00
05/22/2020	BB	L160 A104 Correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.40 hrs	210 /hr	\$84.00
05/22/2020	BB	L160 A108 Review [REDACTED] from opposing counsel re: [REDACTED]	0.20 hrs	210 /hr	\$42.00

05/26/2020	BB	L160 A106 Phone conference with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.20 hrs	210 /hr	\$42.00
05/26/2020	BB	L160 A104 Review [REDACTED]	0.40 hrs	210 /hr	\$84.00
05/26/2020	BB	L160 A108 Phone conference and correspondence with opposing counsel re: [REDACTED]	0.50 hrs	210 /hr	\$105.00
05/26/2020	BB	L160 A106 Phone conference with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.20 hrs	210 /hr	\$42.00
05/26/2020	BB	L160 A106 Phone conferences (2) with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.80 hrs	210 /hr	\$168.00
05/27/2020	BB	L160 A108 Review [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] from opposing counsel	0.40 hrs	210 /hr	\$84.00
05/27/2020	BB	L160 A106 Correspond with [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.20 hrs	210 /hr	\$42.00
05/28/2020	BB	L160 A103 Revise [REDACTED]	0.40 hrs	210 /hr	\$84.00
05/29/2020	BB	L160 A104 Review [REDACTED]	0.20 hrs	210 /hr	\$42.00
TOTAL SERVICES FOR THIS MATTER			22.70 hrs		\$3,762.00

BILLING SUMMARY

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED	22.70 hrs	\$3,762.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF THIS BILL		\$3,762.00
PREVIOUS BALANCE		\$5,968.00
BALANCE DUE		<u>\$9,730.00</u>

Timekeeper Summary

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
Bakhtiari, Babak	15.20	210.00	\$3,192.00
Schneider, Danielle M	7.50	190.00	\$570.00