

Hodges Loizzi  
Eisenhammer Rodick & Kohn LLP

3030 SALT CREEK LANE  
SUITE 202  
ARLINGTON HEIGHTS, ILLINOIS 60005

TELEPHONE: (847) 670-9000  
FACSIMILE: (847) 670-7334  
FEIN: 36-3698066  
www.hlerk.com

Stephanie Christensen  
Post Office Box 71110  
Oak Brook Terrace, IL 60181

April 30, 2020  
Invoice #: 48757

**REMITTANCE COPY**

**RE: PATEL v. HINSDALE 86**  
for [REDACTED]  
**CLAIM NO.:** [REDACTED]  
**ADJUSTER:** Stephanie Christensen  
**Date of Coverage:** February 7, 2020  
**Initial Budget:** \$ [REDACTED]  
**Previous Amount Billed:** \$20,158.00 through 3/31/20

TOTAL SERVICES FOR THIS MATTER \$1,601.00

**BILLING SUMMARY**

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED	7.70 hrs	\$1,601.00
<b>TOTAL AMOUNT OF THIS BILL</b>		<b>\$1,601.00</b>
PREVIOUS BALANCE		\$20,074.00
TOTAL PAYMENTS		\$15,707.00
BALANCE DUE		<u>\$5,968.00</u>

Hodges Loizzi  
Eisenhammer Rodick & Kohn LLP

3030 SALT CREEK LANE  
SUITE 202  
ARLINGTON HEIGHTS, ILLINOIS 60005

TELEPHONE: (847) 670-9000  
FACSIMILE: (847) 670-7334  
FEIN: 36-3698066  
www.hlerk.com

Stephanie Christensen  
Post Office Box 71110  
Oak Brook Terrace, IL 60181

April 30, 2020  
Invoice # 48757

**PATEL v. HINSDALE 86**  
for [REDACTED]  
**CLAIM NO.:** [REDACTED]  
**ADJUSTER:** Stephanie Christensen  
**Date of Coverage:** February 7, 2020  
**Initial Budget:** \$ [REDACTED]  
**Previous Amount Billed:** \$20,158.00 through 3/31/20

04/01/2020	BB	L160 A106 Correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10 hrs	210 /hr	\$21.00
04/01/2020	BB	L160 A106 Correspond with [REDACTED] re: status [REDACTED]	0.20 hrs	210 /hr	\$42.00
04/02/2020	DMS	L110 A104 Review [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.80 hrs	190 /hr	\$152.00
04/08/2020	BB	L160 A108 Correspond with opposing counsel re: [REDACTED]	0.20 hrs	210 /hr	\$42.00
04/08/2020	BB	L160 A106 Correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10 hrs	210 /hr	\$21.00
04/08/2020	BB	L160 A108 Correspond with [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	0.20 hrs	210 /hr	\$42.00
04/09/2020	BB	L120 A106 Correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20 hrs	210 /hr	\$42.00
04/20/2020	BB	L160 A106 Correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10 hrs	210 /hr	\$21.00
04/20/2020	BB	L160 A106 Correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20 hrs	210 /hr	\$42.00
04/20/2020	BB	L160 A104 Review draft [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50 hrs	210 /hr	\$105.00
04/21/2020	BB	L160 A104 Analyze [REDACTED] and prepare [REDACTED]	1.00 hrs	210 /hr	\$210.00

04/21/2020	JTM	L160 A104 Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	1.00 hrs	210 /hr	\$210.00
04/22/2020	BB	L160 A106 Prepare [REDACTED] and [REDACTED]	0.80 hrs	210 /hr	\$168.00
04/23/2020	BB	L160 A104 Prepare for [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50 hrs	210 /hr	\$105.00
04/23/2020	BB	L160 A109 Appearance at [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED]	1.00 hrs	210 /hr	\$210.00
04/27/2020	BB	L160 A106 Correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50 hrs	210 /hr	\$105.00
04/28/2020	BB	L230 A104 Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10 hrs	210 /hr	\$21.00
04/29/2020	BB	L160 A106 Continue preparing [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10 hrs	210 /hr	\$21.00
04/30/2020	BB	L160 A106 Correspond with [REDACTED] re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10 hrs	210 /hr	\$21.00
<b>TOTAL SERVICES FOR THIS MATTER</b>			<b>7.70 hrs</b>		<b>\$1,601.00</b>

**BILLING SUMMARY**

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED	7.70 hrs	\$1,601.00
<b>TOTAL AMOUNT OF THIS BILL</b>		<b>\$1,601.00</b>
PREVIOUS BALANCE		\$20,074.00
TOTAL PAYMENTS		\$15,707.00
BALANCE DUE		<b>\$5,968.00</b>

**Timekeeper Summary**

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
Bakhtiari, Babak	5.90	210.00	\$1,239.00
Schneider, Danielle M	0.80	190.00	\$152.00
Manning, Jason T	1.00	210.00	\$210.00
Domash, Rachel E	0.00	85.00	\$0.00